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Item 2.01. Completion of Acquisition or Disposition of Assets.

OGE Energy Corp. (the "Company") is the parent company of Oklahoma Gas and Electric Company, a regulated
electric utility with approximately 794,000 customers in Oklahoma and western Arkansas, and OGE Enogex Holdings
LLC and its subsidiaries ("Enogex"), a midstream natural gas pipeline business with principal operations in
Oklahoma.

As previously disclosed in the Company's Form 10-Q for the quarter ended June 30, 2012, on August 1, 2012, Enogex
entered into agreements with Chesapeake Midstream Gas Services, L.L.C. and Mid-America Midstream Gas Services,
L.L.C., wholly-owned subsidiaries of Access Midstream Partners, L.P. and Chesapeake Midstream Development,
L.P., respectively, pursuant to which Enogex agreed to acquire approximately 235 miles of natural gas gathering
pipelines, right-of-ways and certain other midstream assets that provide natural gas gathering services in the greater
Granite Wash area. The transactions closed on August 31, 2012. The aggregate purchase price for these transactions
was approximately $80.5 million, including certain permitted capital expenditures incurred during the period
beginning June 1, 2012 and ending August 31, 2012. Enogex utilized cash generated from operations and bank
borrowings to fund the purchase. The purchase price is subject to certain post-closing adjustments. The Company has
not completed the purchase price allocation for these transactions, but expects to complete this in the fourth quarter of
2012.

In connection with these agreements, Enogex entered into a gas gathering and processing agreement with Chesapeake
Energy Marketing, Inc. and Chesapeake Exploration, L.L.C. ("Chesapeake") pursuant to which Enogex will provide
fee-based natural gas gathering, compression, processing and transportation services to Chesapeake with respect to
certain acreage dedicated by Chesapeake. Including the purchase price of the assets discussed above, Enogex projects
additional capital expenditures for the construction of gathering and compression assets associated with these
agreements to be approximately $250 million through the remainder of 2012 and 2013.
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SIGNATURE

Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the registrant has duly caused this report to be
signed on its behalf by the undersigned thereunto duly authorized.

OGE ENERGY CORP.
(Registrant)

By: /s/ Scott Forbes
    Scott Forbes
 Controller and Chief Accounting Officer

September 6, 2012
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